THE CORPORATION OF THE CITY OF BRAMPTON

BY-LAW

Number 6-92

To further amend By-law 68-89
to regulate the use and
erection of signs

WHEREAS the Council of The Corporation of the City of
Brampton enacted By-law 68-89 to regulate the wuse and
erection of signs;

AND WHEREAS notice of this by-law and notice of the
meeting of the Building and By-law Enforcement Committee at
which it was discussed was published in the Brampton
Guardian on , 1991 1in accordance with
section 210, paragraph l44a of the Municipal Act R.S.0. 1980
c.302 as amended; )

NOW THEREFORE the Council of The Corporation of the
City of Brampton ENACTS AS FOLLOWS:

1. In this by-law, all references to section, subsection,
paragraph or clause, letters or numbers refer to By-
law 68-89 as amended.

2. The definition of "Sign" contained in section 3(27) is
hereby amended by adding "banner," after "device" 1in
the first line.

3. Section 6(1) (i) is hereby amended by adding, after the
words "sign area" in the third line, the following:

"and provided that the top of any directional sign is
no higher than 1.5 metres above the finished grade "at
the sign location".

4. Section 8(1) is hereby amended by adding "and section
12" after "section 7" in the first line.

5. Section 8(1l)(a) is hereby amended by deleting "0.5
metres" from the second line and replacing it with
"0.3 metres".

6. Section 8(1)(d) 1is hereby amended by deleting the
words, "main wall" from the second line and replacing
them with "building wall face".

7. Section 8(2) is hereby amended by adding "and section
12" after "section 7" in the first line. )

8. Section 8(3) is hereby amended by adding "and section
12" after "section 7" in the first line.




(.

2

' APPROVED

13 7O FORM

LAV/ DEPT,

BRAMPTON

oare R( th\<

9. Section 11(9) is hereby amended by deleting
"Billboard" from the first line and replacing it with
"Billboards".

10. Section 11 is hereby amended by adding the following
as clause (i):

(1) Any billboard erected as a ground sign shall be
located at least 10 metres from any lot line.

11. Section 12(2) is hereby amended:

(1) by deleting "and" from the second line of
clause (a):

(2) by deleting the period from the end of the
second line of clause (b) and replacing it with
", and"; and

(3) by adding clause (c) as follows:

(c) be non-illuminated.

12. Section 12(3) is hereby amended:

(1) by deleting "and" from the second line of
clause (c):

(2) by deleting the period from the end of clause
(d) and replacing it with "; and"; and

(3) by adding clause (e) as follows:

(e) be non-illuminated.

13. Section 14(3) is hereby amended by deleting "One
Hundred Dollars ($100.00)" from the fourth line and
replacing it with "One Hundred and Sixty Dollars
($160.00)".

14. Section 15 is hereby amended by adding subsection (13)
as follows:

(13) Except as permitted in section 11, no person
shall erect or display, or cause to be erected
or displayed on a lot, a sign or advertising
device which advertises goods and services not
available from, or a business or enterprise not
located upon, the lot upon which the sign or
advertising device is erected or displayed."

READ a FIRST, SECOND and THIRD TIME and PASSED in Open

Council this 27th day of January 199 2.

[ M

Peter Robertson Mayor

Le@. Mikulich Clerk




